

**Bid Opening Worksheet**  
**2021 Roadway Improvement Program**  
**City of Oregon, Ohio**

Date: Tuesday, June 15, 2021

Opened By: Paul Roman, P.E.

Time: 10:00 a.m.

Witnesses: R. Shultz, P.E., B. Biniker, P.E., J. Bosh & J. Davids

Engineer's Estimate:		\$195,000	\$216,000	\$115,000	\$320,000	\$72,500	\$265,000	\$204,000	\$40,000	\$84,000	
Contractor	Bid Guarantee	Project #1	Project #1 Alternate A	Project #1 Alternate B	Project #2	Project #3	Project #4	Project #5	Project #6	Project #7	Notes
Hillabrand & Sons Construction	100%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$226,542.36	\$197,941.90	No Bid	No Bid	
Buckeye Excavating & Construction, Inc.	Penal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$215,535.00	No Bid	No Bid	
Henry W. Bergman, Inc.	10%	\$180,794.00	\$194,486.00	\$110,580.00	\$291,259.00	\$62,825.00	\$287,877.00	\$243,362.00	No Bid	\$76,364.00	
Gerken Paving, Inc.	Penal	\$215,529.20	\$203,264.15	\$136,838.15	\$351,979.85	\$101,876.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Geo Gradel Co.	10%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$289,588.00	\$223,574.00	\$29,437.50	\$79,307.50	
Bowers Asphalt & Paving, Inc.	Penal	\$173,474.50	\$186,378.00	\$100,026.00	\$322,861.00	\$95,500.00	\$264,637.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Hank's Plumbing & Heating	10%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$220,982.25	No Bid	No Bid	
Geddis Paving & Excavating, Inc.	Penal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$259,941.05	\$229,161.50	No Bid	No Bid	
Kokosing Construction Co.	\$28,602.45	\$209,305.40	\$205,475.90	\$115,790.90	\$286,024.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Smith Paving & Excavating, Inc.	Penal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$29,437.50	\$63,508.00	

Bid Tab Results Will Be Available on the City's Web site at [www.oregonhio.org](http://www.oregonhio.org) (Click on Bidding Information )