

Bid Opening Worksheet

2019 Roadway Improvement Program

City of Oregon, Ohio

Date: Friday, May 17, 2019

Opened By: Paul Roman, P.E.

Time: 10:00 a.m.

Witnesses: R. Shultz, P.E., B. Biniker, P.E., K. Wolfe

Engineer's Estimate:		\$265,000	\$220,000	\$170,000	\$235,000	\$105,000	\$265,000	
Contractor	Bid Guarantee	Project #1	Project #2	Project #2 Alternate A	Project #3	Project #4	Project #5	Notes
Henry W. Bergman, Inc.	Penal Sum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$237,560.50	\$111,372.00	No Bid	Project #3 Bid Form not signed. All required bid forms not filled out.
Kokosing Construction Company	Penal Sum	No Bid	\$175,667.20	\$125,215.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Buckeye Excavating & Construction	Penal Sum	\$268,691.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$256,339.00	
Crestline Paving & Excavating	Penal Sum	\$262,370.00	\$214,449.00	\$167,784.00	\$259,935.80	\$115,254.15	\$260,389.35	
Gerken Paving, Inc.	Penal Sum	\$290,697.00	\$175,144.92	\$135,595.70	\$258,302.35	No Bid	No Bid	
Bowers Asphalt & Paving	10%	\$287,597.60	\$171,335.00	\$132,095.25	\$190,538.50	\$130,235.50	\$265,386.50	
Ropper Construction, Inc.	Penal Sum	\$235,807.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Bid Tab Results Will Be Available on the City's Web site at www.oregonhio.org (Click on Bidding Information)								