City of Oregon, Ohio
2019 Solid Waste and Recycling -Bid Tabulation

Date: 8/20/2019 Republic Services Waste Management
Time: 10:00 a.m. 6749 S. Dixie Highway 6525 Wales Road
Opened by: Paul Roman, Director Public Service ERNEE s Erie, Ml 48133 Northwood, OH 43619
Witnesses: Keith Henninger, Beth Gibson & Kelly Wolfe Bid Guarantee $10,000 Bid Bond $10,000 Bid Bond
Estimated Quantity: 6,900
Units: Dwellings or Weekly Stops
ITEM DESCRIPTION
Bid Option 1 [UNLIMITED REFUSE COLLECTION WITH RECYCLING
5-Year Contract Unlimited
Weekly Unlimited Refuse Collection with Yard Waste
Every Other Week (EOW) Recycling with City Carts
Every Other Week (EOW) Bulk Pick Up
Unit Price Per Month Per Dwelling $15.36 NO BID
Total Amount Per Month $105,984.00
Total Cost Year One $1,271,808.00
Fuel Surcharge Adjustment $0.07 PER $0.10 CHANGE IN DIESEL PRICE
CONTRACT EXCEPTIONS: 1) 3.5% PRICE ESCALATOR FOR YEARS 2-5
2) 5-DAY COLLECTION
3) RIGHT OF REFUSAL FOR CONTAMINATED RECYCLING
4) NO GLASS ACCEPTED IN RECYCLE
5) RECYCLE RATE SUBJECT TO CHANGE WITH MARKET
Bid Option 2 [UNLIMITED REFUSE COLLECTION ONLY
5-Year Contract
Weekly Unlimited Refuse Collection with Yard Waste
No Recycling
Every Other Week (EOW) Bulk Pick Up
Unit Price Per Month Per Dwelling $12.17 NO BID
Total Amount Per Month $83,973.00

Total Cost Year One

$1,007,676.00

Fuel Surcharge Adjustment

$0.07 PER $0.10 CHANGE IN DIESEL PRICE

CONTRACT EXCEPTIONS:

1) 3.5% PRICE ESCALATOR FOR YEARS 2-5

2) 5-DAY COLLECTION

Bid Tab Results Will Be Available on the City's Web site at www.oregonohio.org (Click on Bidding Information )
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City of Oregon, Ohio
2019 Solid Waste and Recycling -Bid Tabulation

Date: 8/20/2019 m Republic Services Waste Management

Time: 10:00 a.m. [ om e by | 6749 S. Dixie Highway 6525 Wales Road
Opened by: Paul Roman, Director Public Service s Erie, MI 48133 Northwood, OH 43619
Witnesses: Keith Henninger, Beth Gibson & Kelly Wolfe Bid Guarantee $10,000 Bid Bond $10,000 Bid Bond

Estimated Quantity: 6,900
Units: Dwellings or Weekly Stops

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Bid Option 3 |LIMITED REFUSE COLLECTION WITH RECYCLING

Unit Price Per Month

Total Amount Per Month

5-Year Contract

Weekly Limited Refuse Collection with Yard Waste

In One (1) -96 Gallon Container

Every Other Week (EOW) Recycling w/ City Carts

Every Other Week (EOW) Bulk Pick Up

Unit Price Per Month Per Dwelling $14.00 $20.50

Total Amount Per Month $96,600.00 $141,450.00

Total Cost Year One $1,159,200.00 $1,697,400.00

2nd 96-gallon container rental cost per resident request $6.50 $10.80

Residents rate per ton to take refuse to landfill $32.00 plus fees $47.00

Fuel Surcharge Adjustment $0.07 PER $0.10 CHANGE IN DIESEL PRICE $0.00

CONTRACT EXCEPTIONS: 1) 3.5% PRICE ESCALATOR FOR YEARS 2-5 1) YEARLY INCREASE OF 4% AT CONTRACT ANNIVERSARY DATE
2) 5-DAY COLLECTION 2) RIGHT OF REFUSAL FOR CONTAMINATED RECYCLING
3) RIGHT OF REFUSAL FOR CONTAMINATED RECYCLING|3) GLASS MAY NOT BE ACCEPTED IN RECYCLE
4) NO GLASS ACCEPTED IN RECYCLE 4) RECYCLE RATE SUBJECT TO CHANGE WITH MARKET

5) RECYCLE RATE SUBJECT TO CHANGE WITH MARKET

Bid Option 4 |LIMITED REFUSE COLLECTION ONLY

Unit Price Per Month

Total Amount Per Month

5-Year Contract

Weekly Limited Refuse Collection with Yard Waste

In One (1) -96 Gallon Container

No Recycling

Every Other Week (EOW) Bulk Pick Up

Unit Price Per Month Per Dwelling $11.70 $13.50

Total Amount Per Month $80,730.00 $93,150.00

Total Cost Year One $968,760.00 $1,117,800.00

2nd 96-gallon container rental cost per resident request $6.50 $10.80

Residents rate per ton to take refuse to landfill $32.00 plus fees $47.00

Fuel Surcharge Adjustment $0.07 PER $0.10 CHANGE IN DIESEL PRICE $0.00

CONTRACT EXCEPTIONS: 1) 3.5% PRICE ESCALATOR FOR YEARS 2-5 1) YEARLY INCREASE OF 4% AT CONTRACT ANNIVERSARY DATE

2) 5-DAY COLLECTION

Bid Tab Results Will Be Available on the City's Web site at www.oregonohio.org (Click on Bidding Information )
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City of Oregon, Ohio

2019 Solid Waste and Recycling -Bid Tabulation

Date: 8/20/19

Time: 10:00 a.m.

Opened by: Paul Roman, Director of Public Service
Witnesses: K. Henninger, B. Gibson & K. Wolfe

ST I T,
Ccvy of Clporranics

Republic Services
6749 S. Dixie Highway
Erie, Ml 48133

Waste Management
6525 Wales Road
Northwood, OH 43619

Bid Guarantee

$10,000 Bid Bond

$10,000 Bid Bond

Estimated Quantity: 6,900

Units: Dwellings or Weekly Stops

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Bid Option 5

CITY DEPARTMENTS REFUSE AND UNLIMITED REFUSE COLLECTION

The contractor shall provide the following containers at the locations
specified with a frequency of pick up as indicated below.

City Municipal Building, 5330 and 5350 Seaman Road

One (1) 4 cubic yard dumpster with wheels Weekly per pull $11.41 $31.92
One (1) 4 cubic yard dumpster with wheels Weekly per pull $11.41 $31.92
One (1) 20 cubic yard roll off dumpster Bi-Weekly per pull $185.00 * PLUS $32.00 PER TON (MSW) + FEES $383.42
City Fire Stations, 5002 Seaman Road, 1102 Wheeling and 4421 Bayshore Road
Three (3) 2 cubic yard dumpsters on wheels Weekly per pull $17.11 $10.64 /CONTAINER
With one (1) unit at each Fire Station
Willow Cemetery, 1961 Pickle Road
One (1) 6 cubic yard dumpster Weekly per pull $17.11 $31.92
North Oregon Cemetery, 464 Otter Creek Road
One (1) 6 cubic yard dumpster Weekly per pull $17.11 $31.92
Wastewater Treatment Plant, 4657 DuPont Road
Two (2) 3 cubic yard containers — Wastewater Weekly per pull $25.67 $15.96 /CONTAINER
Two (2) 2 cubic yard containers — Training Ctr Weekly per pull $11.41 $10.64 /CONTAINER
One (1) 20 cubic yard roll-off BiWeekly per pull $185.00 * PLUS $32.00 PER TON (MSW) + FEES $667.00
Water Treatment Plant, 935 North Curtice Road
One (1) 3 cubic yard container Weekly per pull $8.56 $15.96
Recreation Department, 5330 Seaman Road
One (1) 6 cubic yard container Weekly per pull $17.11 $31.92
One (1) 6 cubic yard container -5/1 thru 10/1 Weekly per pull $17.11 $31.92
One (1) 8 cubic yard container for Recycling Weekly per pull $35.00 $42.56
20 Yard Container On Call per pull $185.00 * PLUS $32.00 PER TON (MSW) + FEES NO BID
30 Yard Container On Call per pull $185.00 * PLUS $32.00 PER TON (MSW) + FEES $383.42
3 Yard Container -To Be Paid By Resident
Directly To Contractor On Call per pull $10.27 NO BID
10 Yard Container -To Be Paid By Resident
Directly To Contractor On Call per pull $185.00 * PLUS $32.00 PER TON (MSW) + FEES NO BID *SEE BAGSTER SOLUTION*

CONTRACT EXCEPTIONS:

1) 3.5% PRICE ESCALATOR FOR YEARS 2-5

1) YEARLY INCREASE OF 4% AT CONTRACT

2) 5-DAY COLLECTION

ANNIVERSARY DATE

Bid Tab Results Will Be Available on the City's Web site at www.oregonohio.org (Click on Bidding Information )
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Note

*Republic Dumpster Fees are as Follows:

The roll off pricing is based on a per pull plus disposal rate.
The breakout on some of the options are listed below:

Rate per pull - $185.00
MSW Rate per ton
Base Rate - $32.00 per ton
Fees $5.20 per ton — Lucas County Generator Fee
$0.12 per yard — State of Michigan Fee
4.87% of base rate — Erie Township Host Community Fee
At $32/ton this works out to $1.56/ton
$0.18 per yard Monroe County Fee

Special Waste rate per ton
Base Rate — $27.00/ton (Sewer Sludge & Street Sweepings)
Base Rate - $51/ton (Sewer Grit)
Fees
Same as above
Container liners for roll off boxes
$55 per liner

Examples:

City Building - 20 Yd Dumpster / 10 Tons

Cost Would Be:

Rate per pull

Base Rate $ 32.00
L.C. $ 520
Michigan $ 012
Erie $ 1.56

Monroe $ 0.18

X X X X X

10
10
20
10
20

WWTP - 20 Yd Dumpster / 10 Tons

(Sewer Girit)

Cost Would Be:

Rate per pull

Base Rate $ 51.00
L.C. $ 520
Michigan $ 012
Erie $ 1.56

Monroe $ 0.18
Container Liner

X X X X X

10
10
20
10
20

$ 185.00
$ 320.00
$ 52.00
$ 240
$ 15.60
$ 3.60

$ 578.60

$ 185.00
$ 510.00
$ 52.00
$ 240
$ 15.60
$ 360
$ 55.00

$ 823.60
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