

Bid Opening Worksheet
2018 Roadway Improvement Program
City of Oregon, Ohio

Date: Thursday, May 3, 2018

Opened By:

Paul Roman, P.E.

Time: 2:00 p.m.

Witnesses:

R. Shultz, P.E., B. Biniker, P.E., J. Bosh

Engineer's Estimate:		\$402,000	\$75,000	\$125,000	\$255,000	\$173,000	\$78,000	\$268,000	\$35,000	\$110,000	\$43,000
Contractor	Bid Guarantee	Project #1	Project #1 Alternate A	Project #1 Alternate B	Project #2	Project #3	Project #4	Project #4 Alternate A	Project #5	Project #6	Project #7
Bowers Asphalt & Paving	Penal Sum	\$338,809.00	\$59,819.00	\$103,336.00	\$225,551.00	\$138,784.00	\$80,723.00	\$227,134.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Gerken Paving, Inc.	Penal Sum	\$371,507.35	\$65,004.35	\$111,108.75	\$252,747.30	\$158,984.70	\$77,219.15	\$298,651.40	No Bid	\$114,486.95	\$60,349.75
Henry W. Bergman, Inc.	Penal Sum	\$386,537.00	\$67,057.00	\$118,083.00	\$245,024.00	\$158,244.00	\$74,515.00	\$277,342.00	No Bid	\$98,985.00	\$44,545.00
Crestline Paving & Excavating	Penal Sum	\$438,707.70	\$78,780.00	\$158,765.00	\$279,587.00	\$196,638.00	\$84,772.00	\$329,442.00	\$44,760.00	\$124,754.00	\$46,438.00
Schoen, Inc	10%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$112,843.25	No Bid
Kokosing Construction Company	Penal Sum	\$393,764.50	\$70,268.10	\$120,666.50	\$263,250.80	\$171,557.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Quinn Concrete Construction, Inc.	10%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$35,768.00	No Bid	No Bid
Bid Tab Results Will Be Available on the City's Web site at www.oregonhio.org (Click on Bidding Information)											