

# **Bid Opening Worksheet**

## **2017 Roadway Improvement Program**

### **City of Oregon, Ohio**

**Date:** Wednesday, June 14, 2017

**Opened By:** Paul Roman, P.E.

**Time:** 10:00 a.m.

**Witnesses:** R. Shultz, P.E., B. Biniker, P.E., J. Bosh, J. Buck, B. Anderson

<b>Engineer's Estimate:</b>		\$494,000	\$283,000	\$52,000	\$6,000	\$100,000	\$30,000
<b>Contractor</b>	<b>Bid Guarantee</b>	<b>Project #1</b>	<b>Project #2</b>	<b>Project #3</b>	<b>Project #3A</b>	<b>Project #4</b>	<b>Project #5</b>
<b>Bowers Asphalt &amp; Paving</b>	Penal	\$468,152.50	\$255,479.00	\$65,630.00	\$6,672.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Henry W. Bergman, Inc.</b>	Penal	\$523,474.00	\$297,982.00	\$57,100.00	\$9,750.00	\$103,160.88	\$27,140.00
<b>Quinn Concrete Construction, Inc.</b>	Penal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24,131.50
<b>Gerken Paving, Inc.</b>	Penal	\$514,587.00	\$289,277.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Crestline Paving &amp; Excavating</b>	Penal	\$493,694.05	\$292,785.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Buck Pavement Restoration LLC</b>	Penal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$103,368.64	No Bid
<b>Smith Paving &amp; Excavating, Inc.</b>	Penal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$21,181.50
<b>Bid Tab Results Will Be Available on the City's Web site at <a href="http://www.oregonhio.org">www.oregonhio.org</a> (Click on Bidding Information )</b>							